
REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL ABCT Corp 

P.O Box 7804 
e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. North Brunswick, NJ 08902 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk”. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

  

    

    

      

      

    

    

    

    

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost. Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* 5 195-0 5 a9 5 83.00 tants 14S. 0 

coanolapr 3 WF500 5 294 s@3.0stmn 3 APS-00 

CENBOLA/P § & = $_ Ss 

cuepoasape 5 265.00 ¢$ 297 = 583.0 St s 2 bS. 00 

CT0012A/P* S$ 5 — $ = , = 

DLCMYIA/P*  § — go Ss gs 

EBMSOIAP — § <394,3.00 5 277A 5 G3.0 Shi § B13. 

EBMSOQA/P gC 323.00 B99 5 BB. Smt 5 373.00 

EBMS03A/P s A 43. mo sh 44 5 83 0 frm! 443 .co 

EBMS04A/P $ 244.0 SA YA 53.0 Lips S297. 

EDMSOIA/P sg 0 6 BY 83, ov fran 3Q3.00 

    

    

 



FROOODAIP® § BKB00 6 RAI 5 63.W Sims 223-0 

    

  
  

    

    
  

HMNB36A/P $a So = $= $ 

HRAKBOLA/P* §_ —=— ions § so 

TROO1OA* $= ¢ == § So 

JAJGOO4A/P*  § So S — $ = 

LDNPOIA/P# $$ § $ — $7 
    
  

MENBIZAP 0g WES: 6 B27 563.0 5 ABS 

NSJLOOIA/P* = $ — i 6 $ 
  

PMSO01A/P sBA50 3H ay § 3.00 6305. 

RSTSOOLA/P* S aa . _ $ — $ — 
  

SSENOIA/P* —§ — se $ — ¢ = 
  

SHSOOOIAR «= $ RRS D sHIT 5 83-00 3s AAS 

WBMSIA/P 6 379.0 sR-77 583-00 s377. a 

ARIE AezaAt -NIP 
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

AMC TRANS Cok? 
Company Name 

P.0 Hox ABU Neoéte OwisNiswie, IST 08402 
Company Address and Telephone Number 

3]2t\o023 HN 
Authorized-Bighaturé”// \ (Datel 

ABC Trans Corp 
P.O Box 7804 

North Brunswick, NJ 08902



Angi loSTans 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* $ $ $ $ 

CDABOOIAP §=$A33 7.00 3$_W/A $$ Q-fa $23 7}oeo 

CENBO11A/P $ $ : 5 
    

cupposar 3 Qs we 3 2-Bo s 2h 

    

      

    

    

    

~ CTOOIZAP* * § $ $ $ 

DLCMY1A/P* $ $ $ $ 

EBMSOIA/P —$ § $ § 

EBMS02A/P $ $ $ § 

EBMSO3A/P ss $ $ $ § 

EBMS04A/P ss $ $ $ $ 
    

EDMSOIA/P ss § $e 8 $



FROOO9A/P* $ 5 $ $ 

      

  
  

    

    

    

    

    

    

    

HMNB36A/P $ $ $ $ 

HRAKBOLA/P* § 5 § § 

TROOOA* $ § § § 

JAJGOO4A/P* § § $ § 

LDNPOIA/P* § § $ 5 

MENBI2A/P $ DBSae$ W/A § 2.80 $ Q3S-e0 

NSILOOIA/P* § $ § § 

PMSOOIA/P ss § $ é 6 

RSTSOOIA/P* § § $ § 

SSENOIA/P* — § $ $ § 

SHSOOUIAP «$$ 89.9Q SE § 2-76 SIDVY 

WBMSIA/P ss § $ § $ 
    

Wabwys hehata 
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

AagilosS TRANS 
Compafy Name 

a4 Margad oY, 0ld Brdde, US aP85F 
Company Address and Telephone Number D7 

BHah—_— 3/10/23 
Authorized Signature Date 

 



Bright Sturt Transport 
REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 
unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

‘and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

      

      

      

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: | 

BM0003A* S $ S S : 

CDABOOIA/P sg 2Rl.0o0 ¢O-40 ¢ OD 6 28[.00 

CENBOI1LA/P <UVE OD ¢ 0-90 ¢ O 6 2E8-OO 

CHEDO48A/P 6 2T7T.OO 5 ¢ O 6 2177:00 

CT0012A/P* S $ $ 5 
    

DLCMYLA/P* ¢328-0D0 ¢ 0-90 ¢ 0:00 5 388-00 
    

    

    

    

EBMSO1A/P S S $ $ 

EBMS02A/P S 5 $ $ 

EBMS03A/P $ > $ $ 

EBMS04A/P S $ | $ 5 
    

EDMSO1A/P 6 S $ $ 
   



    

    

    

    

      

    

    

      

    

    

    

    

FRO009A/P* S $ 6 

HMNB36A/P sg. 2S. 00 0.970 5 OC 6 26.00 

HRAKBOLA/P* § 300.00 D.¢0 ¢s40-00 5 360-00 

IROOLOA* 5 $ $ 

JAJGOOAA/P*  § SI]-OO OFO s40:0CO. 537): 

LDNPOIA/P* § 370-00 5 0.90 ¢ 60:00 ¢ 430-00 

MENB12A/P ¢ 265.0D O.70 ¢ O ¢ 265.00 

NSJLOOLA/P*  § 319.00 0.90 ¢ 60-00 § 2379.00 

PMSO01A/P 5 $ § 

RSTSOOIA/P*  § 321.00 O-Ggo 560-00 .3281/-00 

SSENOILA/P*# é g 

sHsooiare «=6 § 28-00 5 OFO 5 O ¢ 26-00 

WBMSIA/P § $ | $ 

Marianette Liriano 
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title’ (Print or Type) 

  

Bright Start Transport LLC 

  

managing partner 

  

Company Name 

491 Neville St Perth Amboy, NJ 08861 
Company Address and Telephone Number 

Hh _— 8/14/2023 
  

Authorized Signature Date



Chris Trans 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

° Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*, Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

  

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

aoe 6 Ow yee oo 

BM0003A* s S250 5_\ ¢ TO gs W2D' 
70 

CDABOOIAP §=§ ARO §__\ s TO." 3s 250" 

cenpouae §=s \QQ'™ 5 \' os GO 5 250" 
ows 

cHEDOSAP §_ —NONT gs | Es TO 5s BRO 

CTOOIZA/P* 2u0'” s pi 5 WO" 5 2an™ 

DLCMYI1A/P*  § eee VE sg BOY s BIO" 

EBMsoIP Sg, ARO s Vi 3s FO s Y20'~ 

EBMSO2AP = g§ SHON 5 s Wd” s _42O 

rpusosae = s-_ OBO" s AN 5 FOr’ s Wro™ 

\ 

\ 

  

  

  

ppmso4are gs (3 90" m™ s TO" 5 Y2o™ 

epmsoiwe = s__ 350" ™ 5 70'% 5 Y2o™



    
  

    
  

    

  

    
  

      

      

    

    
  

      

  

      

rroosar* ¢ WOO > Vi7 5 TO ¢ 4 70"~ 

HMNB36A/P sg § § § 

HRAKBOILA/P* = § $ $ 9 

IROOLOA* s mee To’ «— Y20'™ 

JAIGOO4A/P* § $ $ 

LDNPOIAP* § 3@.H'* ¢$ 400 s 7TOr*s Woo™ 

MENBI2A/P $ $ $ 

NSJLOOIA/P* § § s 

PMSOOIA/P $ § § 

RsTso1ap* § 2QO0s I’ ¢§ To" 5 Zooo™ 

SSENOIA/P* — § $ § § 

sHsooiae S$: ABOYT gs Vt gs HO og {TO 

WBMS1A/P S $ $ > 

Azan, oussel Quen 
  

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

C\n is waas Lb 
Company Name 

36 Demerol’ Ri East Byvuaswick » NO VERre 
Company Address and Telephone Number 

(444222 
Autfigrized Signature Date



HMMANUEL |] RAINS 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*, Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk”. 

° Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* $ $s $ $ 
    

  
ll 

CDABOOIAIP § $e sw. & 

CENBOUAP  §§ 2 § ee eg 

cuepusar §s\Rfioo sQ.00 sh\/A s\S*oo 

crooar*  s\kkioo sO.00 soon sh¥lLoo 

DLCMYIAIP*#  § =~ § Gg 

epMsoIAe «= Ss DARCO sOQ.o0 ss A s#39%00 

EBMSO2AIP $= gg —s SL 

ppMsoArP -s.359%00 30.00 3 \JGQ s35€00 

epMsou4Ar 68 239.00 sQ.00 shIQ s83%o00 

EDMSOIA/P § $ $ $ 
co sO



FRO0009A/P* s22Rv0 §$O,00 $3000 5298 0p 

    
  

  
  

  
  

    
  

    
  

  
  

  
  

    
  

  

HMNB36A/P $78 gs £3 

HRAKBOLA/P* $7 —_ $s, $s, 

IROOLOA* a: § § 

JAJGOO4A/P* _ $ a es $ ~ 

LDNPOLAIP* — § Le sO sf § L 

MENBI2AP  $__ — $4 sf $ LA 

NSILOOIAP*  $ A s $ LZ § rs 

PMSOOLA/P 5 ZL $ wa $ ae § A 

rstsoiar* sd&h.oo $Q.00 3606.00 $Ab¢4.vo 

SSENOLAP* = §_ gs 4 sf § 7 
    
    

7 ri 7 # 

sHsooare s/pVoo so.oo sh ¢ /OX.O 

WBMSIAIP $e gg s 4 

amir Bestawros V WG. 

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print’or Type) 

ULE 
Company Namepo Box 955 

East brunswick, NJ 08816 
  

Company Address and Telephone Number 

it Blok. 8/1 F(R 
Authorized Signature " Date



(sol) SHEp HED TRANS 

BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

@ The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide 
cost for routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

@ Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school 
year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first 
day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be 
bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* $ $ $ $ 
    

CDABOIAR «-$§223..—CO 8 go § WA 6.323 

    

    

    

    

    

CENBOUAP = §-_ (7 Q gs o50 ¢ w/a s )Fo 

cHEDusae §=¢Z2G2 sQSo swe 328? 

CT0012A/P $ $ $ $ 

piomvian «$237 gs 050 3 fo 3 377 

EBMSOIA/P S$ $ § $ 

EBMS02A/P $ : $ $ 
    

  

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District 
Page 35 of 40 
Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services 

Bid Number 2024-02



  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  
  

    

  
  

    
  

  
  

    
  

  
  

  
  

  
  

EBMSO3A/P s s s 

EBMSO4A/P § s s 

EDMSOIAP s s s 

FROOQOIA(P* § s $ 

HMNB36A/P IT1 $0:52 sw/r s 177 

HRAKBOIAPY § 327 sabe 5 SO 5371 

IROOLOA* $ : $ $ 

JAIGOOAP* § 32.) 5 0$0 3 Sa 5 3/) 

tpnpoiart 5423 s@5o_ 3 JO 543 

mMenBiAP «6S }GO 8 SO) 6 WS )Bo 

NSILOIAR* §$ 705 5 0.50 ¢$ SQ 65355 

PMSOOIAP —§ 5 $ s 

rstsoiars ¢ 34/7 s@-5o $s bo 6377 

ssenoiare 3 iol 3 0-50 570 5 7) 

SHS0001A/P BOs pSo 3 4#/h s 1BO 

WBMSIAP ss $ $ s $ 

Andrtt Ba Kb a2 br DQWwhe ce 
  

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

Goo Shephesd Has ot Fad lon 
Company Name 

Jia eed ile rbollfarn Sp Rf bllter all 26f11 bef-3P— b>] / 
Company Address and Telephone Number “ 

ate 
Autiorized Signature 

Obl 21 )23 
“Date © 

  

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District 

Page 36 of 40 
Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services 

Bid Number 2024-02



REVISED BID SHEET 

HAPPY Lim€ 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

  
  

  
    

  
    

    
  

  
  

    

  
    

    
  

    
  

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BMO0003A* S $ 4 $ 

CDABOOIA/P ~— $271.00 § 2.00 $ N/A $ 271.00 

CENBOLLA/P — $201.00 $ 2.00 $ N/A $ 201.00 

CHEDO48A/P —- $201.00 $ 2.00 $ N/A $ 201.00 

CT0012A/P* $ $ $ $ 

DLCMY1A/P*  $ $ $ $ 

EBMSO1A/P S 301.00 S_2.00 S N/A S 301.00 

EBMS02A/P S 281.00 S 2.00 S N/A S 281.00 

EBMS03A/P $ 351.00 $ 2.00 $ N/A $ 351.00 

EBMS04A/P $ 281.00 $ 2.00 ¢ N/A § 281.00 

EDMSO1A/P $ 431.00 $2.00 $ N/A $ 431.00 
    
 



    
  

    
  

  
  

    

      

      

      

      

    

    

    

    

FROOO9A/P* S g S 

HMNB36A/P $ $ $ 

HRAKBOLA/P* $ $ S 

IROOLOA* $ $ $ 

JAJGO04A/P* $ g $ 

LDNPO1A/P* $ S $ 

MENB12A/P $ g 5 

NSJLOO1A/P* $ $ $ 

PMS001A/P 381.00 s 2.00 S NIA S_ 381.00 

RSTSOO1A/P* $ $ $ 

SSENO1A/P* $ g 5 

SHS0001A/P $128.00 § 2.00 S N/A § 128.00 

WBMSILA/P § 471.00 § 2.00 iS N/A § 471.00 

Hany Gebraeil 

    

President 

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

Happy Lime, LLC 

Company Name 

1433 Summerhill Rd, Spotswood, NJ 08884 

Company Address and Telephone Number 
. c 2 

Authorized Sighature 

201-873-7223 

08/21/2023 

Date



RV N RAPE 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 
routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

° Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 
purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 
accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 
unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 
and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

  

    

  

  

    

  

  

  

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* g 600 g 1.95 g 110 § 710 

CDABO01A/P ¢ 600 g 1.95 ¢ ¢ 600 

CENBOI11A/P g 600 g 1.95 S ¢ 600 

CHED048A/P g 600 § 1.95 $ ¢ 600 

CT0012A/P* § no bid S S §no bid 

DLCMYIA/P*  §650 $1.95 g 140 § 790 

EBMSOIA/P g 600 g 1.95 S ¢ 600 

EBMS02A/P § 600 § 1.95 S ¢ 600 

EBMS03A/P $ 600 $ 1.95 S ¢ 600 

EBMS04A/P 5 600 g 1.95 $ ¢ 600 
  

EDMS01A/P s 800 S 1.95 S g 800 
 



      

      

    

    

    
  

    

    

    

    

    

    

    

FROO009A/P* ¢ 600 g 1.95 g 115 g 715 

HMNB36A/P g 600 g 1.95 g ¢ 600 

HRAKBOIA/P* $ no bid e $ ¢no bid 

IROOIOA* g 600 $1.95 g115 - §715 

JAJGOO4A/P* § 650 § 1.95 § 150 § 800 

LDNPOLA/P* — sno bid § S ¢ no bid 

MENB12A/P g 600 $1.95 S g 600 

NSJLO01A/P* g 650 § 1.95 g 150 ¢ 800 

PMS001A/P $ 650 ¢ 1.95 g ¢ 650 

RSTSOO1A/P*  § 650 $1.95 ¢ 150 ¢ 800 

SSENOLA/P* — § no bid § g ¢no bid 

SHS0001A/P § 180 ¢ 1.95 $ ¢ 180 

WBMSIA/P § 650 § 1.95 s § 650 
  

Amy Raphael Corporate Treasurer 

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 
  

Irvin Raphael, Inc. 
  

Company Name 

55 Old Stage Road , East Brunswick, NJ 08816 732-251-2447 

SH and fn Number vi 1 / 

Authorized/ eC 
Ue UES 

 



K-11) Bus SERV Ie 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

° The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

  

  

  

  

    

  

  

  

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* $ 9 9 9 

CDABOOIA/P = $ 02 $1.99 S § 302 

CENB0O11A/P § 295.00 § 1.99 s § 295.00 

CHED048A/P § 249.00 § 1.99 S § 249.00 

CT0012A/P* $ S S s 

DLCMYIA/P* = $ $ $ $ 

EBMS01A/P $ $ $ $ 

EBMS02A/P 9 9 $ $ 

EBMS03A/P S . 3 $ 

EBMS04A/P $ $ S S 
  

EDMS01A/P $ $ $ $



    
  

    
  

  
  

    

    
  

    
  

    
  

    

    

    

    

    

    

  

  

  

FROOO9A/P* $ s S S 

HMNB36A/P § 249.00 $1.99 . s § 249.00 

HRAKBOLA/P* $ $ S$ S 

IROO1LOA* $ $ S S 

JAJGO04A/P* § 220.00 $1.99 6700 § 290 

LDNPO1A/P* § $ S S 

MENB12A/P § 251.00 § 1.99 S § 251.00 

NSJL001A/P* : 5 $ $ 

PMSO0LA/P $ $ $ S 

RSTSO01LA/P* $ $ $ § 

SSENO1A/P* $ $ S $ 

SHS0001A/P § 199.00 S $1.99 § 199.00 

WBMS1A/P S $ $ $ 

Fidelina Estevez- Manager 

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

K&D BUS SERVICE LLC 

Company Name 

11 main st, Somerset nj 08873 , 347-210-7374 

Company Address and Telephone Number 

08/22/23 
  
MOM TERE 

Wuthorized Sigrature ( 2 Date



KERD TRANS LC 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

      

      

      

    

    

    

    

    

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* $ $ $ $ 

CDABO001A/P $ $ $ $ 

CENBOIA/P§ $ $ > 

CHED048A/P § $ $ : 

CT0012A/P* $ $ $ > 

DLCMY1A/P* = $ $ $ $ 

EBMSO1A/P ss § $ $ S$ 

EBMS02A/P $ $ $ $ 

EBMS03A/P $ $ 5 9 

EBMS04A/P $ $ 5 5 
    

EDMS01A/P S $ $ $ 
 



FROOO9A/P* $ . $ $ 
  

  
  

  
  

  
  

    

    

    

      

    

  
  

    

    

HMNB36A/P $ 9 2 $ 

HRAKBOIA/P*  § $ $ $ 

TROO1OA* $ $ $ $ 

JAIGOO4A/P* ss $ $ $ $ 

LDNPO1A/P* $ $ $ 9 

MENB12A/P ss § $ $ $ 

NSJLOOIA/P* = § $ $ $ 

PMS001A/P $ $ $ $ 

RSTSOOIA/P* = § $ $ $ 

SSENOIA/P* = § $ $ $ 

SHSOOOIA/P $79 ¢ 3 $F $s 719 

WBMS1A/P $ $ $ $ 
    

Magedl Me Icha | CmManager) 
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

Kero trans [Lc 
Company Name 

2F te Ab on G Cu! _?be, Beh tbraunsgubics, WIo8 BIE (és 2377545! 
Company Address and Telephone Number 

Van aot BI Co(9p25 
Authorized Signature ea Date



mmeecy TANS PoUnin 

BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide 

cost for routes that do not contain an asterisk’. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school 

year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first 

day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be 

bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

  
  

    
  

  
  

    
  

  
  

    
  

    
  

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* S $ $ 5 

CDABOO1LA/P $ 5 $ 5 

CENBO11A/P S § S S 

CHED048A/P S S $ $ 

CT0012A/P S $ $ $ 

DLCMY 1 A/P S 5 3 $ 

EBMSO1A/P $ $ 5 $ 

EBMS02A/P § S $ $ 
  

  

  

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District 

Page 35 of 40 

Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services 

Bid Number 2024-02



EBMS03A/P S s $ 9 

  

  

  

  

  

    

  

  

  

  
  

    
  

  
  

    
  

  
  

  
  

EBMSO4A/P$ § 5 s 

eomeuae «ODS. 9 2 s 3 953.°° 

FROOOOA/P* s ‘ $ 

HMNB36AIP S$ $ $ s 

HRAKBOLA/P*  $ s s s 

IROOLOA* § § $ s 

JIAIGOO4A/P* § $ s 

LDNPO1A/P* $ $ $ $ 

MENBI2A/P$ § $ s 

NSJLOOIAP* — § $ 5 s 

PMSOOLA/P S BoaX 5 2. * § o 5 553° 

RSTSOOLA/P* — $ $ s s 

SSENOLA/P* § s $ s 

SHSOODIA/P § $ $ 

WBMSIAP = §- SOB s$ 2° g s 953° 
  

  

Sayed Ibrahim, President/CEO 

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

Mercy Transportation Inc. 

Company Name 

13 Major Rd, Monmouth spoon. 08852 

Company Addre fan ne Number 

a 08/21/2023 
Date 

      

Authorized $4 
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NLHEIGHES TPANSpoeT 

BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide 

cost for routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school 

year in accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first 

day of school unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be 

bound to this proposal and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

  
  

  
  

  
  

  
  
  

    
  

  
    

    
    

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* $ $ : > 

CDABO001A/P $ $ $ $ 

CENBO11A/P § 35 § 1.00 S Oo g 375 

CHED048A/P $325 $ 1.00 gs 0 §_ 325 

CT0012A/P S $ $ $ 

DLCMY1A/P $ : $ $ 

EBMSO1LA/P S 5 $ $ 

EBMS02A/P S $ $ $ 
    
    

  

Board of Education of the Township of East Brunswick Public School District 

Page 35 of 40 

Bid Specifications and Proposal Documents for Student Transportation Services 

Bid Number 2024-02



EBMS03A/P $ $ g $ 

  

  

  
  

    
  

  
  

  
  

  
  

  
  

    
  

  
  

  
  

  
  

    
    

    
    

    
  

EBMS04A/P $ $ $ $ 

EDMSO1A/P $ $ $ $ 

FROO09A/P* $ $ $ & 

HMNB36A/P —s $325 $ 1.00 $0 & 325 

HRAKBOIA/P*  § $ $ $ 

IROOLOA* $ $ $ $ 

JAJGOO4A/P* = $ $ $ § 

LDNPOIA/P* = $ $ $ $ 

MENB12A/P $ 160 $1.00 gO $ 160 

NSJLOOLA/P* = $ $ $ $ 

PMSO001A/P $ 6 $ $ 

RSTSOOLA/P* = $ $ $ $ 

SSENO1A/P* $ $ $ $ 

SHS0001A/P § 160 § 1.00 gs  O $ 160 

WBMSIA/P $ 5 $ $ 

Eliane Borbas President/CEO 
  

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

. _NuHeights Transportation 
Company Name 

. ‘ 34 Marion Ave, Springfield, NJ 07081 

“me Address and Telephone Number 
I 

eh abe 8/21/2023 

Authorized Signature Date 
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Rory TO SWCESS 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 
routes that do not contain an asterisk”. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 
accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 
unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 
and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. ° 

  

  

  

  

  

    

  

  

  

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* $ S S S 

CDABOOIAP —$ $ $ $ 

CENBO11A/P $ o__ $ $ 

CHED048A/P = $235.00 50.99 § 85.00 § 235.00 

CT0012A/P* $ 5 $ 2 

DLCMYIA/P* = $ $ s s 

EBMSO1A/P ¢ 251.00 § 0.99 § 85.00 § 251.00 

EBMS02A/P § 249.00 $0.99 § 85.00 § 249.00 

EBMS03A/P § 248.00 $0.99 g 85.00 § 248.00 

EBMS04A/P g 247.00 g0.99 | g 85.00 § 247.00 
  

EDMSO1A/P § 285.00 ¢ 0.99 g 85.00 g 285.00



FROOO9A/P* $ § $ 5, 

      

    

    

      

      

      

      

    

    

    

    

~HMNB36A/P ss § $ $ $ 

HRAKBOIA/P* § § $ $ 

TROOLOA* 2 $ $ $ 

JAJGOO4A/P* S$ S $ S 

LDNPOLA/P* = § § | g e 

MENBI2A/P s g s 

NSJLOOIA/P* = § $ $ é 

PMS001A/P g 284.00 § 0.99 g 85.00 § 284.00 

RSTSOOIA/P* = § § $ $ 

SSENOIA/P* = $ $ $ | $ 

SHS0001A/P g 250.00 § 0.99 § 85.00 § 250.00 

WBMSIA/P ss § § § § 
    

Daniel Da Fonseca - Supervisor 
  
Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

ROAD TO SUCCESS LLC 

Company Name 

281 Summerhill Rd. Suite 202 East Brunswick NJ 08816 908-477-5434 

Company Address and Telephone Number 

| = 8/15/23 
Authorized Signature Date



SIT TRANS LLC 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

    

    

      

  

  

  

    

    

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* S $ $ 5 

CDABO01A/P S $ $ $ 

CENBO011A/P $ S $ $ 

CHED048A/P $ S $ 5 

CT0012A/P* $ $ $ S 

DLCMY1AP* $§ 32BQ sda. § B1o-00 $_ 409. 60 

EBMSO1A/P $ $ $ > 

EBMS02A/P $ $ $ $ 

EBMS03A/P S S $ $ 

EBMS04A/P $ S $ S 
  

EDMSOIA/P sg $ § $ 
 



FROOO9A/P* $ $ $ $ 
  

    

    

    

HMNB36A/P S § $ $ 

HRAKBOIA/P* = $ $ 5 $ 

TROO10A* 5 : . $ 

JAJGO04A/P* $ $ $ $ 
      

LDNPOIAP* $ 39H $add $$ Zo s 465.00 

    

      

    

    

    

    

MENB12A/P $ $ 5 $ 

NSJLOO1A/P* S $ $ $ 

PMSO001A/P S $ $ $ 

RSTSOO1A/P* $ $ $ 2 

SSENO1A/P* 5 $ ° $ 

SHS0001A/P $ $ $ $ 

WBMS1A/P $ 5 $ $ 
    

  

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

o XT Vransg ‘LC 
Company Name 

27 Woster-Blyd wet Zt 1B Eslison, ALT. 08831 | 13218: qTH6 
Company Address and Telephone Number 

Ae pede De cee 09.29.2023 
Authorized Signature , Date



Sh Scttoo-Tfaisp eratin 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 
TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk’. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

  

    

  

  

  

    

  

  

  

  

Route Route Inc/Dec _—Aide/Attendant Total Per 
No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* go $ 2 = $ 

coapoiae ¢ 28 5 AW gH 5 a3 

CENBOLIAP 9 §_ 240 g RA gs = g ane 

CHEDO4sA/P | g_ 6 g Ug = g AY 

CTOOIZA/P*# § *_ $ § $ 

DLCMYIA/P* $7 $ $ § 

EBMSOIAP$§té«SSS $ § 

EBMS02A/P $s $ $ $ 

EBMSO3A/P $§ sé § $ 

EBMS04A/P So $ $ $ 

— 
EDMS01A/P s $ $ 3



FRO009A/P* $ $ $ $ 

    

    
  

    

    

    

    

  

  

    

  

  

  

HMNB36A/P § $ R 

HRAKBOLA/P* § $ é 5 

TROOLOA* = $ é § 

JAJGOO4A/P* — § $ é § 

LDNPOLA/P* = §_ $ é § 

MENBI2A/P $7 $ g 5 

NSJLOOIAIP* = § $ $ $ 

PMS001LA/P . $ é g 

RSTSOOIAP* 5 384-92 g ZAM ¢ FS 5 412-42 

SSENOLA/P# = $7 § 5 § 

SHSOOOIA/P = §_ $ g 5 

WBMSI1A/P $a S S $ 

CASEEN KHBAGAKKE own Ee: 
  

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

SBESwe L Trance tat on * 
  

  

Company Name SAB S 

choo! Transportation 
971 Hoes Lane Suite 209 G79 515 PASY 

Company Address and Telephone Number » stdlaway, NJ 08854 

S: Abubalkew 6/21) 23 
  

Authorized Signature Date



TAKE TYME 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 

purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 

and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

    

    

      

  

    

  
  

    

    

    

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* e § S $ 

CDABOOIA/P ss § § $ S 

CENB011A/P S § $ $ 

. — ID 

CHEDO48A/P § ALO 6 1Q5 ¢ O 5 DLO ~ 

CT0012A/P* $ S S $ 

DLCMYIA/P*  § S $ $ 
27 S oO 

EBMSOIA/P = g§ SD | ¢ O § 335 
. Zs ae 

EBMSO2A/P sg. S55 5 | ¢ O a 355 
. %6 v0 

EBMSO3A/P § BQH 5 | 5 O ¢ 335 

EBMS04A/P é 335 g | g DO S 335 
    

EDMSO1A/P S $ $ $ 
 



FROOO9A/P* S $ 2 $ 
  

    

  
  

    

    
  

    
  

HMNB36A/P —§ § § § 

HRAKBOLA/P*  § § § § 

TROO10A* § 8 § $ 

JAIGOO4A/P* 8g | $ § $ 

LDNPOLA/P* —$ § § $ 

MENBI2A/P ss $ $ $ § 
    

cD 

NSILOOIAP* § 300 ¢ 25 5 G5 $ 

    

    

      

PMSOOIA/P SS ‘ ‘ ‘ 

RSTSOOIA/P*  § 6 ‘ ‘ 

SSENOIA/P* —§ ‘ os ‘ 

em) 5 . 
sHsooiae = =6©§$ AOD s_| 5 O ¢ ZOO 
    

WBMS1A/P S $ $ $ 

nso veu-e— Can22 he. Ce a ee 

Authorized Bidder’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

  

Vay Wee  Vome LIC 
Compaiiy Name = 

Vo Bow 1233 Somerset Od S&81S 15a 253 736 
C ny Address and Telephone Number 

Viable hr) 2023 
Authorized Signature ‘Date



Thkeg BROTHERS 

REVISED BID SHEET 

EAST BRUNSWICK PUBLIC SCHOOLS 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 

TO AND FROM SCHOOL 

e Bids which do not include an adjustment amount will not be accepted. 

e The following routes and aide (if applicable) are to be bid on a -Per Diem basis only 

e Routes which require an aide are so indicated by an asterisk*. Please do not include an aide cost for 

routes that do not contain an asterisk*. 

e Packages will be awarded on the total. Per diem cost per each route in tier is needed for internal 
purposes. 

The undersigned hereby submits the following bid(s) to transport pupils during the 2023-2024 school year in 

accordance with your advertisement, specifications and route description. Start date will be first day of school 

unless otherwise indicated on route description. If awarded the contract, we agree to be bound to this proposal 
and the contract documents, as defined in the specifications. 

Route Route Inc/Dec Aide/Attendant Total Per 

No. Per Diem Adj Cost Per Diem Cost Diem Cost 

SINGLE ROUTES: 

BM0003A* S S $ $ 
    

  

cDABOOIAR S292 3 £94 $ AA 3 292 

CENBOIAR «6s 2QQ 6s fag st 3 399 

CHED048A/P s 243 s Log sM A s Las 

croo2AP*# § Oo $ Jaw $s G2 3 VIP 
a — 

  

    

    

    

    

DLCMYIA/P* — § $ $ $ 

EBMS01A/P S S $ $ 

EBMS02A/P S s 5 $ 

EBMS03A/P S $ $ $ 

EBMS04A/P S S 5 $ 
    

EDMS01A/P S $ $ $



FROOO9A/P* $ $ 9 $ 

HMNB36A/P S 2 Le $f gq s AHA $ CIV 2 

    

    

      

      

    

    

    

      

  

HRAKBOIA/P*  $ $ $ S 

TROO10A* § $ § $ 

JAIGOO4A/P* $ $ § 

LDNPOLA/P* —$ $ § $ 

MENB12A/P $ $ $ $ 

NSJLOOIA/P* § § $ 

PMSOOIA/P ss $ $ § $ 

RSTSOOLA/P*  §_ BRR gs Kemasee sR. gs EER 

SSENOIA/P* $ $ $ 

sHsooia/p = g§ (SQ CS_ Gh $ ALLA s_| 

WBMSI1A/P $ § $ 
    

Bro We 
Authorized Biddet’s Name and Title (Print or Type) 

TWver (5 Votnevs 
Company Name 

TZ Lots A V2 EK Bru nsinnck NEoXX\ (Ru XBtA% 
Company puceness and Telephone | Number 

F %1 2112 
Bea Signature 

‘Dats C 5 

 


